
Schedule a Curbside Bulky Item Collection 

Single-family residents are eligible for one or more free curbside bulky item collections 

for furniture, mattresses, e-waste, appliances, or miscellaneous household items. See 

reverse side of postcard or check with your hauler for complete details. 
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Printed on 100% post-consumer recycled paper  

Carmel-by-the Sea, Del Rey Oaks, Marina, Pacific 

Grove, Pebble Beach CSD, Sand City, Seaside

Monterey Disposal 

831.372.7977 

www.montereydisposal.com 

Waste Management 

800.321.8226 

www.wm.com 

City of Monterey Unincorporated Monterey County 

GreenWaste Recovery Monterey Disposal Waste Management 

Single-family Customers: Customers may request 
up to three (3) bulky item reuse on-call collection 
events each year at no additional charge. Each col-
lection event may include up to two (2) cubic yards 
of reusable materials, five (5) e-Waste items, and 
two (2) appliances or bulky items during each event. 
Appliances containing Freon count as two (2) bulky 
items. Additional eligible items may be collected for 
an additional “per item” charge. Additional events 
may be scheduled for an additional “per event” 
charge. To schedule your bulky item reuse collection 
event, please contact Customer Service.  

Multi-family Customers: Your complex may be 
eligible to participate in a complex-wide bulky item 
reuse collection event, please contact your property 
manager for additional information. For an addition-
al charge, GreenWaste can collect bulky items. To 
schedule your bulky item collection, please contact 
Customer Service.  

Bulky Item Collection Pickup Guidelines 

Single-family Customers: Large items such as appli-
ances and furniture can be picked up upon request 
for standard residential customers (sorry, this ser-
vice is not offered to multifamily or commercial 
customers). Most items are collected at no addition-
al charge. However, some items (mattresses, refrig-
erators, TVs, computers, etc.) require special han-
dling at the landfill and are charged at the landfill's 
special handling rates. Up to 3 large items can be 
picked up per appointment, and four appointments 
are allowed per year. All you have to do is call 372-
7977 to schedule the appointment and place the 
items out on the curb on the date given by our staff 
by 8:00 a.m. 

Multi-family Customers: Available to Multi-Family 
for a fee, please call for details. 

Single-family Customers: Customers may receive 
one (1) free on-call collection service per calendar 
year. Call to schedule your on-call service on your 
next regular collection day. Then place the follow-
ing accepted materials within three (3) feet of the 
curb, beside your regularly serviced carts: 

 Bulky Items (e.g., mattresses, couches, furni-
ture)—up to five (5) cubic yards 

 Universal Waste (except fluorescent tubes),
electronics waste, and CED’s—up to one-half 
(0.5) cubic yards total. Please place in bags, 
boxes or containers. 

 Tires—up to two (2) car tires 

Multi-family Customers: Customers may request on
-call collection service at no cost. Ask your property 
manager to call us to set up this service. 

The following items will not be collected: Any sin-
gle item that cannot be handled by two (2) people 
using a dolly, as well as: 

 Hazardous waste, including anti-freeze 

 Concrete or Dirt 

 More than two (2) tires 

Charges will apply if you exceed the limits set. 




